
From:                                         dmccormick@delco�mes.com on behalf of Delco Times Legals
<legals@delco�mes.com>

Sent:                                           Monday, August 22, 2022 2:45 PM
To:                                               Perna Hipp
Subject:                                     Re: Radnor Township Stormwater Management Ordinance, No. 2022-15
 
Good afternoon,
The below has been scheduled for Aug 24 and account # 881839 will
be invoiced $598.31
Thank you
 
ad # 2367552

 
 
On Mon, Aug 22, 2022 at 1:57 PM Perna Hipp <PHipp@grimlaw.com> wrote:

mailto:PHipp@grimlaw.com


Dear Legal Department:  Please find a�ached correspondence, legal no�ce and ordinance to be
adver�sed one (1) �me in your Wednesday, August 24, 2022 edi�on.  Thank you.  Please do not
hesitate to contact our office with any ques�ons.
 
 

Perna P. Hipp
Assistant to John B. Rice, Esquire
Assistant to William D. Oetinger, Esquire
Office: (215) 257-6811 Ext. 119 / Fax: (215) 257-5374 
104 S. Sixth Street, P.O. Box 215, Perkasie, PA 18944
www.grimlaw.com

 
 

 
--
***Please remember to ONLY USE  legals@delco�mes.com  for your legal adver�sing and
ques�ons***
DEADLINE: IS 1:30 PM MON - FRI.
Thank you
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